
[LAFARGE CANADA INC [8000386100]] VOLVO L220H 003543 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP381988
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 8000386100

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT (CE)1051 Heritage Rd.Burlington, ONCA  L7L 4Y1Contact: Michael Hribarmhribar@strongco.comT: F: (905)643-6077
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the airfilter, air induction system, and anyareas where dirt may enter thecomponent. We recommend that youdrain the oil from the component ifthis has not already been done. Werecommend you service the filters onthis component. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. We have assumed thatthis component is not breaking in(age of component not reported).Fuel content negligible. There is amoderate concentration of dirtpresent in the oil. Viscosity of sampleindicates oil is within SAE 30 range,advise investigate. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0252Unique No: 5684038Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 28 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02598958 (Generated: 11/28/2023 16:03:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Michael Hribar - VOLVO0252

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP381988 --- --- ---Sample Date 23 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.0 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 67 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 80 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 60 --- --- ---Glycol % 0.0 --- --- ---Fuel % 0.7 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 26 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 14 --- --- ---Copper ppm 312 --- --- ---Lead ppm 8 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 86 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2129 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 84 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1165 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 956 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 26 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02598958 (Generated: 11/28/2023 16:03:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Michael Hribar - VOLVO0252
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 003543\Diesel Engine [VCP381988] 23 Nov 2023 @ .0 hrs

