
[TRIPLE M [8000385852]] VOLVO EC480E 315055 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP392496
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 8000385852

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT (CE)1051 Heritage Rd.Burlington, ONCA  L7L 4Y1Contact: C. Carterccarter@strongco.comT: F: (905)643-6077
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Light fuel dilution occurring. Noother contaminants were detected inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0252Unique No: 5684053Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 28 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02598973 (Generated: 11/28/2023 10:40:37) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: C. Carter - VOLVO0252

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP392496 VCP380148 VCP391690 ---Sample Date 23 Nov 2023 05 Sep 2023 21 Jul 2023 ---Machine Hours 1705 982 664 ---Oil Hours 0 500 0 ---Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.2 11.9 10.4 ---Oxidation (PA) % 89 82 75 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Soot % % 0 0 0 ---Nitration (PA) % 68 58 83 ---Sulfation (PA) % 65 64 62 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % 1.1 0.9 0.9 ---Silicon ppm 6 7 29 ---Sodium ppm 2 2 4 ---Potassium ppm 0 <1 4 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 10 6 15 ---Copper ppm 23 111 203 ---Lead ppm 2 3 6 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 2 ---Aluminum ppm 2 1 3 ---Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 42 43 84 ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm <1 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 0 <1 3 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1669 1732 2089 ---Magnesium ppm 542 476 124 ---Zinc ppm 1080 1071 1162 ---Phosphorus ppm 880 973 1048 ---Barium ppm <1 0 <1 ---Boron ppm 21 32 18 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02598973 (Generated: 11/28/2023 10:40:40) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: C. Carter - VOLVO0252
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480E 315055\Diesel Engine [VCP392496] 23 Nov 2023 @ 1705.0 hrs

