
[LIL] VOLVO A30E R0850 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP391528
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

Strongco Equipment Sudbury41 Vagnini Court, RR1Lively, ONCA  P3Y 1K8Contact: Glenn SkiltonGSkilton@strongco.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor. No other corrective action isrecommended at this time. The fluidwas not specified, however, a fluidmatch indicates that this fluid is SAE30 Diesel Engine Oil.  Please confirmthe oil type and grade, and specifythe brand of the oil on your nextsample.All component wear rates arenormal. Light fuel dilution occurring.No other contaminants weredetected in the oil. Viscosity ofsample indicates oil is within SAE 30range, advise investigate. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP755111Unique No: 5684906Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 01 Dec 2023
Report Id: VP755111 [WCAMIS] 02599826 (Generated: 12/01/2023 12:53:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Glenn Skilton - VP755111

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP391528 --- --- ---Sample Date 29 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 13379 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.4 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 69 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.5 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 70 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 57 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 2.5 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 58 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 852 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1006 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1156 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1007 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 32 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP755111 [WCAMIS] 02599826 (Generated: 12/01/2023 12:53:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Glenn Skilton - VP755111
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30E R0850\Diesel Engine [VCP391528] 29 Nov 2023 @ 13379.0 hrs

