
[GUAY] GROVE GMK6400-1 6400-4017 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP352900
Oil Type: CASTROL HYSPIN AWH-M ISO 32
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.72 CHEMIN DU TREMBLAYBOUCHERVILLE, QCCA  J4B 6Z6Contact: Jonathan Jobinjjobin@strongco.comT: F: (450)449-7913
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The system cleanliness isacceptable for your target ISO 4406cleanliness code. The system andfluid cleanliness is acceptable. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SHEBOUUnique No: 5685644Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 05 Dec 2023
Report Id: SHEBOU [WCAMIS] 02600564 (Generated: 06/07/2024 10:28:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jonathan Jobin - SHEBOU

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP352900 VCP394736 --- ---Sample Date 15 Nov 2023 14 Nov 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 129 128 --- ---Oil Hours 129 128 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 30.5 32.3 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Particles >4µm 219 241 --- ---Particles >6µm 62 51 --- ---Particles >14µm 6 5 --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 15/13/10 15/13/10 --- ---Silicon ppm 4 <1 --- ---Sodium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm <1 0 --- ---Copper ppm 2 <1 --- ---Lead ppm 1 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 0 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm <1 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 0 0 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 50 50 --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 0 --- ---Zinc ppm 474 486 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 378 394 --- ---Barium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Boron ppm <1 <1 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEBOU [WCAMIS] 02600564 (Generated: 06/07/2024 10:28:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jonathan Jobin - SHEBOU
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	GROVE GROVE GMK6400-1 6400-4017\Hydraulic System [VCP352900] 15 Nov 2023 @ 129.0 hrs

