
[[381835]] XCMG XE360U THKA00106 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP352604
Oil Type: SAE 80W90
Job No: 381835

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT-EDMONTON25616 117 Ave NWAcheson, ABCA  T7X 6C2Contact: Jason Sweetjsweet@strongco.comT: PhoneF: (780)417-2615
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. Confirm the sourceof the lubricant being utilized for top-up/fill. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor this condition.The fluid was specified as (GENERIC)SAE 80W90, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is SAE 10WTransmission/Drive Train Oil.  Pleaseconfirm the oil type and grade onyour next sample.PQ levels areabnormal. Chromium and iron andnickel ppm levels are abnormal.Aluminum ppm levels are noted.Titanium ppm levels are marginal.Gear wear is indicated. The highferrous density (PQ) index indicatesthat abnormal wear is occurring.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. Highamount of ingressed dirt has causedabrasive wear to the component.Viscosity of sample indicates oil iswithin SAE 10W range, adviseinvestigate. This plus the additivelevels indicates that this is not thesame brand, or type of oil asreported. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO3908Unique No: 5694099Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 07 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO3908 [WCAMIS] 02601014 (Generated: 12/07/2023 18:50:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jason Sweet - VOLVO3908

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP352604 --- --- ---Sample Date 14 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4022 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 821 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 39 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 45 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSPQ 881 --- --- ---Iron ppm 2224 --- --- ---Copper ppm 6 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 192 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 24 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 11 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 12 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 20 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2200 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 68 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1019 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 800 --- --- ---Barium ppm 7 --- --- ---Boron ppm 12 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3908 [WCAMIS] 02601014 (Generated: 12/07/2023 18:51:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jason Sweet - VOLVO3908
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	XCMG XCMG XE360U THKA00106\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP352604] 14 Nov 2023 @ 4022.0 hrs

