
[TREEWORKS [8000387220]] VOLVO ECR145E 316021 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP392025
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 8000387220

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.55 ISNOR DRIVE, BURNSIDE INDUSTRIALPARKDARTMOUTH, NSCA  B3B 1N6Contact: Justin Hennigarjhennigar@strongco.comT: (902)468-5010F: (902)468-2468
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor. No other corrective action isrecommended at this time.Metallevels are typical for a newcomponent breaking in. Light fueldilution occurring. No othercontaminants were detected in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: SHEDARUnique No: 5694303Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 07 Dec 2023
Report Id: SHEDAR [WCAMIS] 02601218 (Generated: 12/07/2023 09:32:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Justin Hennigar - SHEDAR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP392025 --- --- ---Sample Date 01 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 977 --- --- ---Oil Hours 500 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.7 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 81 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 66 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 61 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 1.7 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 8 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 41 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 18 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 35 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1699 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 438 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1046 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 859 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 34 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEDAR [WCAMIS] 02601218 (Generated: 12/07/2023 09:32:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Justin Hennigar - SHEDAR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR145E 316021\Diesel Engine [VCP392025] 01 Dec 2023 @ 977.0 hrs

