
[[385964]] 16-8901 - DIESEL ENGINESample No: VCP380097
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3

CRH CANADA GROUP INC.P.O. BOX 5400CONCORD, ONCA  L4K 1B6Contact: Dan Browndan.brown@ca.crh.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: HOLCONUnique No: 5695895Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 13 Dec 2023
Report Id: HOLCON [WCAMIS] 02602810 (Generated: 05/29/2024 14:36:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dan Brown - HOLCON

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number VCP380097 VCP392216 VCP392355 VCP349667Sample Date 10 Dec 2023 06 Aug 2023 23 Apr 2023 01 Jul 2022Machine Hours 4500 4000 3462 2963Oil Hours 500 500 500 500Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITION
Visc @ 100°C cSt 12.4 12.6 12.5 12.7Oxidation (PA) % 81 80 82 84
 CONTAMINATION
Water % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0 0 0 0Nitration (PA) % 54 58 64 59Sulfation (PA) % 62 63 61 63Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 5 6 5Sodium ppm 3 2 2 3Potassium ppm <1 1 <1 <1
 WEAR METALS
Iron ppm 5 5 5 5Copper ppm <1 1 3 3Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 1 1 2 1Chromium ppm 0 0 0 0Molybdenum ppm 39 41 46 37Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVES
Calcium ppm 1667 1648 1843 1650Magnesium ppm 498 513 532 482Zinc ppm 1050 1090 1125 1040Phosphorus ppm 904 984 1049 910Barium ppm <1 0 0 0Boron ppm 52 50 53 57

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: HOLCON [WCAMIS] 02602810 (Generated: 05/29/2024 14:36:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dan Brown - HOLCON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 16-8901\Diesel Engine [VCP380097] 10 Dec 2023 @ 4500.0 hrs

