
[[386577]] VOLVO EC300E 312753 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP394126
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 386577

Strongco Equipment5179 Fountain St N.Breslau, ONCA  N0B 1M0Contact: Matt Criscimcrisci@strongco.comT: (519)744-3518F: (519)744-3284
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. The filter changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Chromium ppm levels aresevere. Ring wear is indicated. Thereis a light amount of silt (particulates< 14 microns in size) present in theoil. Viscosity of sample indicates oil iswithin ISO 32 range, adviseinvestigate. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: CASKITUnique No: 5695954Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 14 Dec 2023
Report Id: CASKIT [WCAMIS] 02602869 (Generated: 12/14/2023 14:54:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Matt Crisci - CASKIT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP394126 VCP334258 VCP273626 ---Sample Date 02 Dec 2023 28 Aug 2022 01 Nov 2020 ---Machine Hours 9900 8300 4000 ---Oil Hours 4000 4000 4000 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed ---Sample Status SEVERE SEVERE ATTENTION ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 36.1 48.4 43.0 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Particles >4µm 60011 343 2249 ---Particles >6µm 19086 39 357 ---Particles >14µm 1645 6 22 ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 23/21/18 16/12/10 18/16/12 ---Silicon ppm 2 2 3 ---Sodium ppm 1 1 2 ---Potassium ppm 0 <1 1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 9 5 ---Copper ppm 4 8 18 ---Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Chromium ppm 28 31 11 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 <1 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Silver ppm <1 0 <1 ---Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 65 71 237 ---Magnesium ppm 2 1 2 ---Zinc ppm 423 390 625 ---Phosphorus ppm 336 371 501 ---Barium ppm <1 0 <1 ---Boron ppm <1 <1 <1 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CASKIT [WCAMIS] 02602869 (Generated: 12/14/2023 14:54:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Matt Crisci - CASKIT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC300E 312753\Hydraulic System [VCP394126] 02 Dec 2023 @ 9900.0 hrs

