
[WESFINCH [8-387530]] VOLVO L120H 632979 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP394300
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40
Job No: 8-387530

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.1640 ENTERPRISE ROADMISSISSAUGA, ONCA  L4W 4L4Contact: Janice Crippsjcripps@strongco.comT: (905)565-3876F: (905)670-2338
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SHEMISUnique No: 5696843Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 18 Dec 2023
Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02603758 (Generated: 12/18/2023 12:32:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP394300 VCP394969 VCP380906 VCP332543Sample Date 08 Dec 2023 10 Jul 2023 20 Dec 2022 27 Jun 2022Machine Hours 5045 4018 2992 2006Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.4 12.8 13.3 12.2Oxidation (PA) % 83 66 88 73
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.3 0.2 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 74 76 77 79Sulfation (PA) % 62 53 67 59Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 4 6 7Sodium ppm 2 2 3 2Potassium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 17 18 19 27Copper ppm 2 2 4 12Lead ppm <1 1 <1 2Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 1Aluminum ppm 5 4 6 9Chromium ppm <1 1 1 2Molybdenum ppm 48 61 48 58Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm <1 <1 0 <1Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1685 1159 1744 1184Magnesium ppm 641 959 594 956Zinc ppm 1190 1232 1136 1240Phosphorus ppm 977 1081 1036 1038Barium ppm <1 0 0 <1Boron ppm 20 3 23 4

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02603758 (Generated: 12/18/2023 12:32:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 632979\Diesel Engine [VCP394300] 08 Dec 2023 @ 5045.0 hrs

