
[ABL TIMBER LTD] VOLVO EC220D NOUNITVCP212691 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP212691
Oil Type: KLONDIKE HEAVY DUTY 15W40
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.55 ISNOR DRIVE, BURNSIDE INDUSTRIALPARKDARTMOUTH, NSCA  B3B 1N6Contact: Lindsay Downsldowns@strongco.comT: (902)468-5010F: (902)468-2468
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere contaminants can enter thesystem. The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. No othercorrective action is recommended atthis time.All component wear ratesare normal. Light fuel dilutionoccurring. There is a trace ofmoisture present in the oil. Test forglycol is negative. No othercontaminants were detected in theoil. Viscosity of sample indicates oil iswithin SAE 30 range, adviseinvestigate. The oil is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: SHEDARUnique No: 5697151Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 21 Dec 2023
Report Id: SHEDAR [WCAMIS] 02604066 (Generated: 01/05/2024 06:11:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Lindsay Downs - SHEDAR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP212691 --- --- ---Sample Date 13 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 12000 --- --- ---Oil Hours 200 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 9.5 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 40 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.142 --- --- ---Soot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 42 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 47 --- --- ---Glycol % 0.0 --- --- ---Fuel % 1.1 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 17 --- --- ---Copper ppm 17 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 30 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 514 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 465 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 762 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 633 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 4 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEDAR [WCAMIS] 02604066 (Generated: 01/05/2024 06:11:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Lindsay Downs - SHEDAR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC220D NOUNITVCP212691\Diesel Engine [VCP212691] 13 Dec 2023 @ 12000.0 hrs

