
[[388282]] GROVE RT58D 220282 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP380885
Oil Type: PETRO CANADA HYDREX MV 32
Job No: 388282

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT--CALGARY7923 54TH STREET SECALGARY, ABCA  T2C 4R7Contact: Tracey Lewintlewin@strongco.comT: (403)216-1010F: (403)216-1016
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere contaminants can enter thesystem. Check seals and/or filters forpoints of contaminant entry. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.Iron ppm levels areabnormal. The low ferrous density(PQ) index indicates the wear metallevels are due to corrosion. There is ahigh amount of particulates (2 to 100microns in size) present in the oil.There is a moderate concentration ofwater present in the oil. Free waterpresent. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO3909Unique No: 5698108Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 27 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02605023 (Generated: 12/27/2023 12:22:39) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: Tracey Lewin - VOLVO3909

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP380885 VCP379515 VCP381354 ---Sample Date 20 Dec 2023 12 Dec 2022 01 Dec 2022 ---Machine Hours 6052 0 0 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status SEVERE ABNORMAL SEVERE ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 31.8 31.9 34.5 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.249 0.003 NEG ---Particles >4µm 341364 19644 109434 ---Particles >6µm 214722 4214 27467 ---Particles >14µm 21641 134 403 ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 26/25/22 21/19/14 24/22/16 ---Silicon ppm 10 <1 5 ---Sodium ppm 2 0 1 ---Potassium ppm 1 0 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSPQ 9 --- --- ---Iron ppm 24 <1 5 ---Copper ppm 5 <1 6 ---Lead ppm 3 0 2 ---Tin ppm 0 0 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 3 0 <1 ---Chromium ppm <1 0 0 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 0 ---Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 0 0 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 131 158 1180 ---Magnesium ppm 3 3 5 ---Zinc ppm 446 447 714 ---Phosphorus ppm 368 385 641 ---Barium ppm 0 0 2 ---Boron ppm 4 3 30 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02605023 (Generated: 12/27/2023 12:22:41) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: Tracey Lewin - VOLVO3909
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	GROVE GROVE RT58D 220282\Hydraulic System [VCP380885] 20 Dec 2023 @ 6052.0 hrs

