
[WADDINGTON] 60609 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP386736
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

GREAT WEST EQUIPMENT RENTAL FLEET4700 COLLIER PLACEWILLIAMS LAKE, BCCA  V2G 5E9Contact: Aaron Ericksonaerickson@gwequipment.comT: (250)392-9599F: 
Diagnosis
Check seals and/or filters for pointsof contaminant entry. We advise thatyou check all areas where dirt canenter the system. The air breatherrequires service.  If unrated, werecommend that you replace with asuitable micron rated and/ordesiccant air breather.  If rated, werecommend that you service/replacethe breather. We recommend youservice the filters on this component.Resample in 30-45 days to monitorthis situation. Please specify thebrand, type, and viscosity of the oilon your next sample.Copper ppmlevels are abnormal. Aluminum ppmlevels are noted. Bearing and/orbushing wear is indicated. There is ahigh amount of silt (particulates < 14microns in size) present in the oil.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. Highamount of ingressed dirt has causedabrasive wear to the component. Theoil is no longer serviceable as a resultof the abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: MAR4700WILUnique No: 5707073Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 03 Jan 2024
Report Id: MAR4700WIL [WCAMIS] 02605987 (Generated: 01/03/2024 10:55:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Aaron Erickson - MAR4700WIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP386736 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 18970 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 47.0 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Particles >4µm 120653 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 18112 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 35 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 24/21/12 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 25 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSPQ 0 --- --- ---Iron ppm 36 --- --- ---Copper ppm 105 --- --- ---Lead ppm 5 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 9 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 6 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 15 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1395 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 24 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 631 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 577 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 47 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: MAR4700WIL [WCAMIS] 02605987 (Generated: 01/03/2024 10:55:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Aaron Erickson - MAR4700WIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	KOMATSU 60609\Hydraulic System [VCP386736] 20 Dec 2023 @ 18970.0 hrs

