
[WADDINGTON] 60609 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP386733
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

GREAT WEST EQUIPMENT RENTAL FLEET4700 COLLIER PLACEWILLIAMS LAKE, BCCA  V2G 5E9Contact: Aaron Ericksonaerickson@gwequipment.comT: (250)392-9599F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: MAR4700WILUnique No: 5707077Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 03 Jan 2024
Report Id: MAR4700WIL [WCAMIS] 02605991 (Generated: 01/03/2024 10:56:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Aaron Erickson - MAR4700WIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP386733 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 18970 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 71.1 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 37 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 66 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 7 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2266 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 12 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1190 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 977 --- --- ---Barium ppm 3 --- --- ---Boron ppm 251 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: MAR4700WIL [WCAMIS] 02605991 (Generated: 01/03/2024 10:56:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Aaron Erickson - MAR4700WIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	KOMATSU 60609\Transmission [VCP386733] 20 Dec 2023 @ 18970.0 hrs

