
[[390399]] VOLVO L220H 3315 - DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF)

Sample No: VCP297740
Oil Type: DEF (Diesel Exaust Fluid)
Job No: 390399

STRONGCO INC1730 RUE DE L`HYDROVAL D`OR, QCCA  J9P 6Z2Contact: Kevens Morneaukmorneau@strongco.comT: F: (819)825-1360
Diagnosis
Fluid does not meet ISO 22241-2requirements. Contact supplier.{notapplicable} There is no indication ofany contamination in the dieselexhaust fluid (def). Density is low.

Depot: VOLVO0229Unique No: 5709743Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 15 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0229 [WCAMIS] 02608657 (Generated: 01/15/2024 17:02:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Kevens Morneau - VOLVO0229

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP297740 --- --- ---Sample Date 09 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 8999 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONHydrocarbon scalar NONE --- --- ---
 DEF CONDITION

Urea Content % 32.1 --- --- ---Density @ 20°C g/cm3 1.0860 --- --- ---Refracting Index 1.3821 --- --- ---Appearance scalar Clear & Bright --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Sample Color & Clarity

Report Id: VOLVO0229 [WCAMIS] 02608657 (Generated: 01/15/2024 17:02:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Kevens Morneau - VOLVO0229
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 3315\Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) [VCP297740] 09 Jan 2024 @ 8999.0 hrs

