
[[8000389895]] VOLVO ECR305CL 110051 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP393175
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 8000389895

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.1640 ENTERPRISE ROADMISSISSAUGA, ONCA  L4W 4L4Contact: Janice Crippsjcripps@strongco.comT: (905)565-3876F: (905)670-2338
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak. The oilchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Test for glycol is positive.There is a high concentration ofglycol present in the oil. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: SHEMISUnique No: 5709997Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 16 Jan 2024
Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02608911 (Generated: 01/16/2024 16:52:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP393175 VCP132195 --- ---Sample Date 15 Jan 2024 29 May 2012 --- ---Machine Hours 15678 2084 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status SEVERE NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.1 12.0 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 73 58 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Soot % % 0.1 0 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 65 48 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 59 74 --- ---Glycol % 0.639 NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 0.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 12 4 --- ---Sodium ppm 284 0 --- ---Potassium ppm 10 5 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 23 4 --- ---Copper ppm 7 <1 --- ---Lead ppm 3 <1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 5 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 44 6 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 2 0 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1713 2601 --- ---Magnesium ppm 425 118 --- ---Zinc ppm 1084 1369 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 967 998 --- ---Barium ppm <1 0 --- ---Boron ppm 49 31 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02608911 (Generated: 01/16/2024 16:52:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR305CL 110051\Diesel Engine [VCP393175] 15 Jan 2024 @ 15678.0 hrs

