
[[8000389895]] VOLVO ECR305CL 110051 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP393161
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: 8000389895

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.1640 ENTERPRISE ROADMISSISSAUGA, ONCA  L4W 4L4Contact: Janice Crippsjcripps@strongco.comT: (905)565-3876F: (905)670-2338
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere contaminants can enter thesystem. We recommend that youdrain the coolant from thecomponent if this has not alreadybeen done. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.{not applicable} The samplecontained a visible layer of foreignfluid contaminant, the origin and/ortype of fluid is unknown. The coolantis no longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: SHEMISUnique No: 5710238Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 23 Jan 2024
Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02609152 (Generated: 01/23/2024 08:50:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP393161 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 15678 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSand/Dirt scalar NONE --- --- ---Debris scalar NONE --- --- ---Precipitate scalar NONE --- --- ---Silt scalar NONE --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02609152 (Generated: 01/23/2024 08:50:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR305CL 110051\Coolant [VCP393161] 15 Jan 2024 @ 15678.0 hrs

