
[LAFARGE HAMILTON [391698]] VOLVO L260H 1324 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP392080
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 391698

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT (CE)1051 Heritage Rd.Burlington, ONCA  L7L 4Y1Contact: C. Carterccarter@strongco.comT: F: (905)643-6077
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateamount of silt (particulates < 14microns in size) present in the oil. Theoil is still serviceable provided thatthe contaminant(s) can be reduced toacceptable levels.

Depot: VOLVO0252Unique No: 5710506Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 19 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02609420 (Generated: 01/19/2024 11:20:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: C. Carter - VOLVO0252

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP392080 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2117 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.007 --- --- ---Particles >4µm 28960 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 2568 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 98 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 22/19/14 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 2 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 56 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 409 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 336 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02609420 (Generated: 01/19/2024 11:20:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: C. Carter - VOLVO0252
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L260H 1324\Hydraulic System [VCP392080] 16 Jan 2024 @ 2117.0 hrs

