
[REGION OF PEEL [8-390041]] VOLVO L60H 622563 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP450324
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40
Job No: 8-390041

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.1640 ENTERPRISE ROADMISSISSAUGA, ONCA  L4W 4L4Contact: Janice Crippsjcripps@strongco.comT: (905)565-3876F: (905)670-2338
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SHEMISUnique No: 5711256Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 22 Jan 2024
Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02610170 (Generated: 01/22/2024 15:32:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP450324 VCP392256 VCP382292 VCP353326Sample Date 05 Jan 2024 14 Jul 2023 10 Mar 2023 09 Dec 2022Machine Hours 5025 4030 3450 3002Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.2 13.0 13.0 13.2Oxidation (PA) % 85 84 86 89
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.2 0 0Nitration (PA) % 61 64 60 64Sulfation (PA) % 63 63 70 67Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 8 7 6 8Sodium ppm 2 3 2 3Potassium ppm <1 <1 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 11 8 9Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm <1 0 0 0Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 3 3 3 3Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 35 37 41 43Nickel ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1795 1812 1808 1804Magnesium ppm 443 478 520 519Zinc ppm 1072 1115 1097 1100Phosphorus ppm 945 996 1026 1010Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 25 25 38 30

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02610170 (Generated: 01/22/2024 15:32:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L60H 622563\Diesel Engine [VCP450324] 05 Jan 2024 @ 5025.0 hrs

