
VOLVO EC460C 110503 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP115235
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No:

HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLY CO122 FRITZ ROADLOCK HAVEN, PAUS  17745Contact: TERRY HESSthess@hwyequip.comT: (570)769-1070F: (570)769-1071
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the component.The condition of the oil is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: HIGLOCUnique No: 5718132Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 26 Oct 2011
Report Id: HIGLOC [WUSCAR] 02951573 (Generated: 07/12/2023 11:49:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TERRY HESS - HIGLOC

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP115235 --- --- ---Sample Date 21 Oct 2011 --- --- ---Machine Hours 288 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 158.3 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 29 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 166 --- --- ---Copper ppm 13 --- --- ---Lead ppm 5 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 6 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 7 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 24 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 14 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1148 --- --- ---Barium ppm 8 --- --- ---Boron ppm 2 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: HIGLOC [WUSCAR] 02951573 (Generated: 07/12/2023 11:49:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TERRY HESS - HIGLOC
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC460C 110503\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP115235] 21 Oct 2011 @ 288.0 hrs

