
[TRIPLE M METAL LP [392282]] VOLVO EC480 315055 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP450286
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 392282

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT (CE)1051 Heritage Rd.Burlington, ONCA  L7L 4Y1Contact: LLoyd Williamslwilliams@strongco.comT: F: (905)643-6077
Diagnosis
The filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. There is amoderate amount of silt (particulates< 14 microns in size) present in theoil. The oil is still serviceable providedthat the contaminant(s) can bereduced to acceptable levels.

Depot: VOLVO0252Unique No: 5720945Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 31 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02611850 (Generated: 01/31/2024 11:38:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LLoyd Williams - VOLVO0252

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP450286 VCP380156 --- ---Sample Date 25 Jan 2024 05 Sep 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 2066 982 --- ---Oil Hours 0 1000 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.2 44.6 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Particles >4µm 64060 23567 --- ---Particles >6µm 20747 1926 --- ---Particles >14µm 1055 45 --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 23/22/17 22/18/13 --- ---Silicon ppm 2 2 --- ---Sodium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2 3 --- ---Copper ppm 7 9 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 0 0 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 45 86 --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 1 --- ---Zinc ppm 460 551 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 374 465 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 0 <1 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02611850 (Generated: 01/31/2024 11:38:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LLoyd Williams - VOLVO0252
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480 315055\Hydraulic System [VCP450286] 25 Jan 2024 @ 2066.0 hrs

