
[FONDERIE HORNE [8000392189]] VOLVO ECR145EL 311565 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP392413
Oil Type: VOLVO API GL-5 SAE 75W90
Job No: 8000392189

STRONGCO INC1730 RUE DE L`HYDROVAL D`OR, QCCA  J9P 6Z2Contact: Stephan Constantsconstant@strongco.comT: F: (819)825-1360
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateconcentration of dirt present in theoil. The oil is no longer serviceabledue to the presence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0229Unique No: 5722009Signed: Bill QuesnelReport Date: 01 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0229 [WCAMIS] 02612914 (Generated: 02/01/2024 17:30:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Stephan Constant - VOLVO0229

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP392413 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 11176 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 133 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 91 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 418 --- --- ---Copper ppm 66 --- --- ---Lead ppm 6 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 12 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 6 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 6 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 8 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 64 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 12 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 57 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 974 --- --- ---Barium ppm 3 --- --- ---Boron ppm 189 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0229 [WCAMIS] 02612914 (Generated: 02/01/2024 17:30:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Stephan Constant - VOLVO0229
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR145EL 311565\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP392413] 27 Jan 2024 @ 11176.0 hrs

