
[FONDERIE HORNE [8000392189]] VOLVO ECR145EL 311565 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP392412
Oil Type: VOLVO API GL-5 SAE 75W90
Job No: 8000392189

STRONGCO INC1730 RUE DE L`HYDROVAL D`OR, QCCA  J9P 6Z2Contact: Stephan Constantsconstant@strongco.comT: F: (819)825-1360
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0229Unique No: 5722010Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 01 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0229 [WCAMIS] 02612915 (Generated: 02/01/2024 16:49:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Stephan Constant - VOLVO0229

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP392412 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 11176 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 135 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 41 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 271 --- --- ---Copper ppm 26 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 62 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 10 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 46 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 969 --- --- ---Barium ppm 3 --- --- ---Boron ppm 195 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0229 [WCAMIS] 02612915 (Generated: 02/01/2024 16:49:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Stephan Constant - VOLVO0229
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR145EL 311565\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP392412] 27 Jan 2024 @ 11176.0 hrs

