
VOLVO G976 NOUNITVCE243319 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCE243319
Oil Type: CO-OP D-MO SAE 15W40
Job No:

City of Steinbach51 Millwork RoadSteinbach, MBCA  R2G 2J1Contact: Randy Reimerrreimer@steinbach.caT: (204)346-6215F: (204)346-6239
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateamount of fuel present in the oil.Tests confirm the presence of fuel inthe oil. Fuel is present in the oil and islowering the viscosity. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: CIT51STEUnique No: 5723015Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 08 Feb 2024
Report Id: CIT51STE [WCAMIS] 02613920 (Generated: 02/08/2024 12:34:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Randy Reimer - CIT51STE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE243319 --- --- ---Sample Date 29 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 8489 --- --- ---Oil Hours 544 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.5 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 79 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.3 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 86 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 62 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 7.3 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 6 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 4 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 84 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2099 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 15 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1103 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 959 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 35 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CIT51STE [WCAMIS] 02613920 (Generated: 02/08/2024 12:35:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Randy Reimer - CIT51STE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO G976 NOUNITVCE243319\Diesel Engine [VCE243319] 29 Jan 2024 @ 8489.0 hrs

