
[LAKESIDE [8-391799]] VOLVO ECR145E 315896 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP449497
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: 8-391799

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.1640 ENTERPRISE ROADMISSISSAUGA, ONCA  L4W 4L4Contact: Janice Crippsjcripps@strongco.comT: (905)565-3876F: (905)670-2338
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. Please specifythe brand, type, and viscosity of theoil on your next sample.Tin ppmlevels are abnormal. Bearing and/orbushing wear is indicated. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: SHEMISUnique No: 5723245Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 08 Feb 2024
Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02614150 (Generated: 02/08/2024 08:32:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP449497 VCP353032 --- ---Sample Date 23 Jan 2024 03 Oct 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 2044 505 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 59.0 140 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 9 10 --- ---Sodium ppm 7 3 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 334 204 --- ---Copper ppm <1 <1 --- ---Lead ppm <1 0 --- ---Tin ppm 21 15 --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 8 5 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 5 4 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 36 19 --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 30 15 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1960 282 --- ---Barium ppm 1 1 --- ---Boron ppm 162 <1 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02614150 (Generated: 02/08/2024 08:32:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR145E 315896\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP449497] 23 Jan 2024 @ 2044.0 hrs

