
[GFL [8-393399]] VOLVO EC220E 310830 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP449358
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: 8-393399

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.1640 ENTERPRISE ROADMISSISSAUGA, ONCA  L4W 4L4Contact: Janice Crippsjcripps@strongco.comT: (905)565-3876F: (905)670-2338
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Confirmthe source of the lubricant beingutilized for top-up/fill. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Iron and nickelppm levels are abnormal. The lowferrous density (PQ) index indicatesthe wear metal levels are due tocorrosion. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Viscosityof sample indicates oil is within SAE80 range, advise investigate. This plusthe additive levels indicates that thisis not the same brand, or type of oilas reported. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: SHEMISUnique No: 5724220Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 14 Feb 2024
Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02615125 (Generated: 02/14/2024 08:41:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP449358 VCP352284 VCP252198 VCP212531Sample Date 02 Feb 2024 10 Jun 2022 24 Apr 2020 15 Feb 2019Machine Hours 6000 3980 2002 492Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 58.6 214 145 182
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 680 500 125 26Sodium ppm 36 25 9 4Potassium ppm 40 30 9 2
 WEAR METALSPQ 337 1103 370 ---Iron ppm 3840 1188 633 219Copper ppm 11 2 1 <1Lead ppm <1 <1 0 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 109 82 21 4Chromium ppm 24 8 8 3Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm 10 4 6 2Titanium ppm 7 6 2 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 26 10 6 3Vanadium ppm 0 <1 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 412 271 115 23Magnesium ppm 87 61 21 5Zinc ppm 26 4 14 11Phosphorus ppm 2169 473 952 435Barium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Boron ppm 195 9 114 <1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02615125 (Generated: 02/14/2024 08:41:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC220E 310830\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP449358] 02 Feb 2024 @ 6000.0 hrs

