
[WASTE MANAGEMENT [395098]] VOLVO L90H 626468 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP430108
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 395098

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT4535 LOUIS B MAYERLAVAL, QCCA  H7P 6B5Contact: Philippe Sarrazinpsarrazin@strongco.comT: (450)686-8911F: (450)686-0703
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Iron ppmlevels are abnormal. Gear wear isindicated. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilis no longer serviceable as a result ofthe abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: SHEBAIUnique No: 5733471Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 20 Feb 2024
Report Id: SHEBAI [WCAMIS] 02616361 (Generated: 02/21/2024 16:46:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Philippe Sarrazin - SHEBAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP430108 --- --- ---Sample Date 13 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2031 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.0 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 20 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSPQ 236 --- --- ---Iron ppm 348 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 5 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 5 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4127 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 17 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1632 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1345 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 120 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEBAI [WCAMIS] 02616361 (Generated: 02/21/2024 16:46:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Philippe Sarrazin - SHEBAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 626468\Rear Axle [VCP430108] 13 Feb 2024 @ 2031.0 hrs

