
[CAVANAGH [394790]] VOLVO EC480EL 314289 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP380076
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 394790

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT54 IBER ROADOTTAWA, ONCA  K2S 1E8Contact: Daniel Simarddsimard@strongco.comT: (613)836-6633F: (613)836-2614
Diagnosis
Confirm the source of the lubricantbeing utilized for top-up/fill.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was specified asVOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90GL-5, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is SAE 40Transmission/Drive Train Oil.  Pleaseconfirm the oil type and grade onyour next sample.All component wearrates are normal. The water content isnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Viscosityof sample indicates oil is within SAE40 range, advise investigate. This plusthe additive levels indicates that thisis not the same brand, or type of oilas reported. The condition of the oilis acceptable for the time in service.

Depot: SHESTIUnique No: 5734305Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 23 Feb 2024
Report Id: SHESTI [WCAMIS] 02617195 (Generated: 02/23/2024 10:28:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Daniel Simard - SHESTI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP380076 VCP349512 --- ---Sample Date 14 Feb 2024 16 Oct 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 6034 4032 --- ---Oil Hours 2000 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL SEVERE --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 97.6 154 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.087 0.066 --- ---Silicon ppm 466 701 --- ---Sodium ppm 30 42 --- ---Potassium ppm 40 62 --- ---
 WEAR METALSPQ --- 731 --- ---Iron ppm 849 4725 --- ---Copper ppm 2 8 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 110 167 --- ---Chromium ppm 8 45 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 5 --- ---Nickel ppm 1 2 --- ---Titanium ppm 6 10 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 6 35 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2426 848 --- ---Magnesium ppm 50 64 --- ---Zinc ppm 946 260 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 834 450 --- ---Barium ppm <1 3 --- ---Boron ppm 6 5 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHESTI [WCAMIS] 02617195 (Generated: 02/23/2024 10:28:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Daniel Simard - SHESTI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EL 314289\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP380076] 14 Feb 2024 @ 6034.0 hrs

