
[VINCI [392571]] VOLVO EC950F 410078 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP394351
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 392571

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT--CALGARY7923 54TH STREET SECALGARY, ABCA  T2C 4R7Contact: Tracey Lewintlewin@strongco.comT: (403)216-1010F: (403)216-1016
Diagnosis
Check for low coolant level. Weadvise that you check the air filter, airinduction system, and any areaswhere dirt may enter the component.The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend you service the filters onthis component. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Water treatmentchemicals present, indicating slowcoolant leak. There is a moderateconcentration of dirt present in theoil. Test for glycol is negative. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service (seerecommendation). The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO3909Unique No: 5734475Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 23 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02617365 (Generated: 02/23/2024 06:39:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tracey Lewin - VOLVO3909

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP394351 VCP347436 --- ---Sample Date 21 Feb 2024 14 Sep 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 3908 88 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.5 10.8 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 85 22 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Soot % % 0.7 0 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 88 27 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 72 34 --- ---Glycol % 0.0 0.0 --- ---Fuel % <1.0 0.5 --- ---Silicon ppm 26 23 --- ---Sodium ppm 946 4 --- ---Potassium ppm 27 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 23 --- ---Copper ppm 3 8 --- ---Lead ppm <1 2 --- ---Tin ppm <1 3 --- ---Aluminum ppm 5 3 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 74 80 --- ---Nickel ppm 2 2 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 0 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1596 2151 --- ---Magnesium ppm 556 63 --- ---Zinc ppm 1068 1122 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 904 1061 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 27 60 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02617365 (Generated: 02/23/2024 06:39:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tracey Lewin - VOLVO3909
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC950F 410078\Diesel Engine [VCP394351] 21 Feb 2024 @ 3908.0 hrs

