
[SAIT] GROVE RT5H0E 224541 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP449377
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT--CALGARY7923 54TH STREET SECALGARY, ABCA  T2C 4R7Contact: Tracey Lewintlewin@strongco.comT: (403)216-1010F: (403)216-1016
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Weadvise that you flush the componentthoroughly before re-filling with oil.We recommend you service the filterson this component. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is a moderateamount of silt (particulates < 14microns in size) present in the oil.High concentration of dirt present inthe oil. The oil is still serviceableprovided that the contaminant(s) canbe reduced to acceptable levels.

Depot: VOLVO3909Unique No: 5734546Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 23 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02617436 (Generated: 02/23/2024 10:47:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tracey Lewin - VOLVO3909

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP449377 VCP333920 VCP179553 ---Sample Date 21 Feb 2024 25 Jan 2022 25 Jan 2017 ---Machine Hours 10524 1953 0 ---Oil Hours 0 0 700 ---Oil Changed Not Changd N/A Not Changd ---Sample Status SEVERE SEVERE SEVERE ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 30.9 27.3 27.7 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Particles >4µm 11412 117743 10566 ---Particles >6µm 523 30114 153 ---Particles >14µm 26 1203 21 ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 21/16/12 24/22/17 21/14/12 ---Silicon ppm 4046 5606 2170 ---Sodium ppm 1 1 3 ---Potassium ppm 1 <1 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2 2 2 ---Copper ppm 4 6 2 ---Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 <1 0 ---Aluminum ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Chromium ppm 2 3 3 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 <1 0 ---Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 792 1172 1419 ---Magnesium ppm 4 4 6 ---Zinc ppm 627 759 789 ---Phosphorus ppm 562 687 659 ---Barium ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Boron ppm 15 17 14 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02617436 (Generated: 02/23/2024 10:47:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tracey Lewin - VOLVO3909
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	GROVE GROVE RT5H0E 224541\Hydraulic System [VCP449377] 21 Feb 2024 @ 10524.0 hrs

