
[VINCI [392571]] VOLVO EC950F 410078 - FRONT LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP449385
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 392571

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT--CALGARY7923 54TH STREET SECALGARY, ABCA  T2C 4R7Contact: Lucas Slusarenkolslusarenko@strongco.comT: F: (403)216-1016
Diagnosis
Confirm the source of the lubricantbeing utilized for top-up/fill.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Additivelevels indicate the addition of adifferent brand, or type of oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO3909Unique No: 5734601Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 22 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02617491 (Generated: 02/22/2024 17:29:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Lucas Slusarenko - VOLVO3909

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP449385 --- --- ---Sample Date 09 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3908 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 151 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 34 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 224 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 9 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 14 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 11 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1768 --- --- ---Barium ppm 10 --- --- ---Boron ppm 81 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02617491 (Generated: 02/22/2024 17:29:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Lucas Slusarenko - VOLVO3909
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC950F 410078\Front Left Final Drive [VCP449385] 09 Feb 2024 @ 3908.0 hrs

