
[TRIPLE M METAL [396718]] VOLVO A40G 353438 - TANK UNKNOWN COMPONENT

Sample No: VCP393851
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 396718

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT (CE)1051 Heritage Rd.Burlington, ONCA  L7L 4Y1Contact: Michael Hribarmhribar@strongco.comT: F: (905)643-6077
Diagnosis
The sample change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor. Please provide morecomplete information on your nextsample.All component wear rates arenormal. There is no indication of anycontamination in the sample. Thecondition of the sample is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0252Unique No: 5746702Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 13 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02621583 (Generated: 03/13/2024 11:09:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Michael Hribar - VOLVO0252

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP393851 --- --- ---Sample Date 07 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4722 --- --- ---Oil Hours 4000 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 17 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 28 --- --- ---Copper ppm 24 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 6 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3537 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 8 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1514 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1359 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 106 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02621583 (Generated: 03/13/2024 11:09:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Michael Hribar - VOLVO0252
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 353438\Tank Unknown Component [VCP393851] 07 Mar 2024 @ 4722.0 hrs

