
[[397864]] VOLVO L120H 632081 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP334411
Oil Type: DIESEL FUEL No. 2
Job No: 397864

STRONGCO EQUIP (AB)6 - 38403 BURNT LAKE TRAILRED DEER COUNTY, ABCA  T4S 2L4Contact: Perry Doylepdoyle@strongco.comT: (403)391-3520F: (403)346-3487
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere contaminants can enter thesystem. We recommend that youdrain the fuel from the component ifthis has not already been done.{notapplicable} Glycol contaminationlevels are severely high. The fuel is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO9652Unique No: 5748301Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 21 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO9652 [WCAMIS] 02623182 (Generated: 03/21/2024 07:31:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Perry Doyle - VOLVO9652

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP334411 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 34905 --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO9652 [WCAMIS] 02623182 (Generated: 03/21/2024 07:31:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Perry Doyle - VOLVO9652
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 632081\Diesel Fuel [VCP334411] 11 Mar 2024 @ 34905.0 hrs

