
[TRIPLE M METAL LP [MLF-MAR14-022]] VOLVO L220H 2461 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP450471
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: MLF-MAR14-022

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT (CE)1051 Heritage Rd.Burlington, ONCA  L7L 4Y1Contact: Sue Hootonshooton@strongco.comT: (905)331-3835F: (905)643-6077
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Elevated aluminum (Al)and/or lead (Pb) and potassium (K)levels in your metals analysis arelikely a result of solder flux releaseinto the lubricant and is common onnew equipment/components. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0252Unique No: 5748801Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 21 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02623682 (Generated: 03/21/2024 13:37:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Crane - Sue Hooton - VOLVO0252

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP450471 VCP392082 VCP380077 VCP430009Sample Date 20 Mar 2024 08 Feb 2024 04 Dec 2023 25 Sep 2023Machine Hours 75254 24447 23552 22894Oil Hours 1000 0 0 894Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.8 12.7 12.3 12.3Oxidation (PA) % 83 87 84 84
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0 0.1 0.1 0Nitration (PA) % 58 63 59 57Sulfation (PA) % 62 64 62 62Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 2.1 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 2 4 4 4Sodium ppm 6 2 2 3Potassium ppm 6 <1 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 7 9 7Copper ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 4 4 3Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 37 38 38 40Nickel ppm <1 <1 2 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 0 0 0 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1644 1655 1566 1632Magnesium ppm 495 482 476 506Zinc ppm 1024 1026 1026 1057Phosphorus ppm 877 892 854 874Barium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Boron ppm 30 30 27 24

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02623682 (Generated: 03/21/2024 13:37:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Crane - Sue Hooton - VOLVO0252
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 2461\Diesel Engine [VCP450471] 20 Mar 2024 @ 75254.0 hrs

