
[TRIPLE M METAL [MLF-MAR14-020]] VOLVO EC700C 110606 - UNKNOWN COMPONENT

Sample No: VCP448150
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: MLF-MAR14-020

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT (CE)1051 Heritage Rd.Burlington, ONCA  L7L 4Y1Contact: Sue Hootonshooton@strongco.comT: (905)331-3835F: (905)643-6077
Diagnosis
Little or no information is provided asto the component and lubricantbeing tested.  Recommendations aretherefore generic in nature and maynot apply to the current application.Please forward information as toequipment type, reservoir capacity,lubricant type and any pertinentinformation to allow for a moreaccurate assessment. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Please provide more completeinformation on your next sample.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the sample. Thecondition of the sample is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0252Unique No: 5748959Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 21 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02623840 (Generated: 03/21/2024 16:43:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Crane - Sue Hooton - VOLVO0252

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP448150 --- --- ---Sample Date 19 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 29157 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 138 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm <1 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 26 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 82 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 32 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1021 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 172 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02623840 (Generated: 03/21/2024 16:43:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Crane - Sue Hooton - VOLVO0252
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC700C 110606\Unknown Component [VCP448150] 19 Mar 2024 @ 29157.0 hrs

