
[[8000397962]] VOLVO EC290BLC 13115 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP450438
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 8000397962

STRONGCO EQUIP (AB)6 - 38403 BURNT LAKE TRAILRED DEER COUNTY, ABCA  T4S 2L4Contact: Perry Doylepdoyle@strongco.comT: (403)391-3520F: (403)346-3487
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We advise thatyou flush the component thoroughlybefore re-filling with oil. Confirm thesource of the lubricant being utilizedfor top-up/fill. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Test for glycol is positive.There is a moderate concentration ofglycol present in the oil. Additivelevels indicate the addition of adifferent brand, or type of oil. The oilis no longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO9652Unique No: 5749263Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 25 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO9652 [WCAMIS] 02624144 (Generated: 03/25/2024 16:21:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Perry Doyle - VOLVO9652

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP450438 --- --- ---Sample Date 19 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 12990 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.5 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 63 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 42 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 57 --- --- ---Glycol % 0.048 --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 6 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 6 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1960 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 12 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1007 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 884 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 170 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO9652 [WCAMIS] 02624144 (Generated: 03/25/2024 16:21:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Perry Doyle - VOLVO9652
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC290BLC 13115\Diesel Engine [VCP450438] 19 Mar 2024 @ 12990.0 hrs

