
[LAFARGE [1001-119]] VOLVO L260H 1373 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP380985
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 1001-119

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.1640 ENTERPRISE ROADMISSISSAUGA, ONCA  L4W 4L4Contact: Janice Crippsjcripps@strongco.comT: (905)565-3876F: (905)670-2338

Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. No othercorrective action is recommended atthis time.Nickel ppm levels areabnormal. Exhaust valve wear isindicated. Light fuel dilutionoccurring. No other contaminantswere detected in the oil. Viscosity ofsample indicates oil is within SAE 30range, advise investigate. The oil isno longer serviceable as a result ofthe abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: SHEMISUnique No: 5749981Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 28 Mar 2024
Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02624862 (Generated: 04/04/2024 21:11:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP380985 VCP380059 --- ---Sample Date 15 Mar 2024 07 Dec 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 1578 1054 --- ---Oil Hours 500 1000 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.5 10.8 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 83 78 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Soot % % 0.2 0.2 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 66 85 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 64 65 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % 1.1 1 --- ---Silicon ppm 5 20 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 4 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 4 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12 23 --- ---Copper ppm 25 132 --- ---Lead ppm 0 5 --- ---Tin ppm <1 3 --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 2 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 44 83 --- ---Nickel ppm 4 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 0 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1742 2133 --- ---Magnesium ppm 465 167 --- ---Zinc ppm 1083 1189 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 911 958 --- ---Barium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Boron ppm 29 16 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02624862 (Generated: 04/04/2024 21:11:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L260H 1373\Diesel Engine [VCP380985] 15 Mar 2024 @ 1578.0 hrs

