
[LKQ [MLF-MAR14-018]] VOLVO L70G 614241 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP450470
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: MLF-MAR14-018

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT (CE)1051 Heritage Rd.Burlington, ONCA  L7L 4Y1Contact: Sue Hootonshooton@strongco.comT: (905)331-3835F: (905)643-6077
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0252Unique No: 5750015Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 27 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02624896 (Generated: 03/27/2024 12:36:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Crane - Sue Hooton - VOLVO0252

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP450470 VCP430183 VCP353446 VCP380849Sample Date 21 Mar 2024 10 Jan 2024 15 Mar 2023 28 Dec 2022Machine Hours 16840 16437 15011 14599Oil Hours 1000 2000 500 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.0 12.6 13.7 13.0Oxidation (PA) % 80 85 57 87
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0 0.1 0 0.1Nitration (PA) % 53 63 71 67Sulfation (PA) % 61 62 62 66Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 1.2 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 5 5 6Sodium ppm 2 2 3 2Potassium ppm 0 <1 2 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 9 10 12Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 4 5 7 7Chromium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 38 39 9 42Nickel ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 2 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 0 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1693 1689 1548 1776Magnesium ppm 505 503 710 502Zinc ppm 1063 1049 1219 1092Phosphorus ppm 908 936 1144 1024Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 43 28 65 29

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02624896 (Generated: 03/27/2024 12:36:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Crane - Sue Hooton - VOLVO0252
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70G 614241\Diesel Engine [VCP450470] 21 Mar 2024 @ 16840.0 hrs

