
[MEDLOG [392438]] KONE CRANES SMV453L 862540 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP393056
Oil Type: SAE 15W40
Job No: 392438

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.72 CHEMIN DU TREMBLAYBOUCHERVILLE, QCCA  J4B 6Z6Contact: Jonathan Lamontagnejlamontagne@strongco.comT: (450)449-4666F: (450)449-7913
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Light fuel dilutionoccurring. Fuel is present in the oiland is lowering the viscosity. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SHEBOUUnique No: 5762581Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 18 Apr 2024
Report Id: SHEBOU [WCAMIS] 02629449 (Generated: 04/19/2024 14:03:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jonathan Lamontagne - SHEBOU

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP393056 --- --- ---Sample Date 10 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1007 --- --- ---Oil Hours 850 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.7 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 81 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 87 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 61 --- --- ---Glycol % 0.0 --- --- ---Fuel % 3.7 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 11 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 16 --- --- ---Copper ppm 410 --- --- ---Lead ppm 10 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 33 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1702 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 433 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1001 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 859 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 31 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEBOU [WCAMIS] 02629449 (Generated: 04/19/2024 14:03:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jonathan Lamontagne - SHEBOU
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	KONE CRANES KONE CRANES SMV453L 862540\Diesel Engine [VCP393056] 10 Apr 2024 @ 1007.4 hrs

