
[TRIPLE M [400465]] VOLVO EC380EL VCE380EJ00310375 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP448154
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 400465

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT (CE)1051 Heritage Rd.Burlington, ONCA  L7L 4Y1Contact: Sue Hootonshooton@strongco.comT: (905)331-3835F: (905)643-6077
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Aluminumppm levels are abnormal. Piston wearis indicated. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilis no longer serviceable as a result ofthe abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO0252Unique No: 5763286Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 22 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02630154 (Generated: 04/22/2024 08:01:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Crane - Sue Hooton - VOLVO0252

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP448154 VCP381009 VCP382113 VCP380848Sample Date 18 Apr 2024 17 May 2023 09 Jan 2023 22 Dec 2022Machine Hours 13269 11825 11249 8771Oil Hours 1000 0 20 500Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.8 12.4 13.8 12.3Oxidation (PA) % 84 82 53 87
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0 0 0 0Nitration (PA) % 71 62 53 62Sulfation (PA) % 59 60 56 67Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 1.9 <1.0 1.6Silicon ppm 13 11 7 40Sodium ppm 2 3 3 8Potassium ppm 2 1 3 6
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 69 11 5 32Copper ppm 2 2 <1 6Lead ppm 1 <1 <1 2Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 2Aluminum ppm 12 5 2 6Chromium ppm 2 <1 0 1Molybdenum ppm 40 34 5 41Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 2 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 1 <1 3Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1686 1719 1427 1738Magnesium ppm 507 530 684 502Zinc ppm 1020 1084 1146 1084Phosphorus ppm 872 1016 1091 1014Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 39 55 97 51

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02630154 (Generated: 04/22/2024 08:01:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Crane - Sue Hooton - VOLVO0252
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC380EL VCE380EJ00310375\Diesel Engine [VCP448154] 18 Apr 2024 @ 13269.2 hrs

