
[TRIPLE M [400465]] VOLVO EC380EL VCE380EJ00310375 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP448158
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 400465

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT (CE)1051 Heritage Rd.Burlington, ONCA  L7L 4Y1Contact: Sue Hootonshooton@strongco.comT: (905)331-3835F: (905)643-6077
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateconcentration of water present in theoil. The oil is no longer serviceabledue to the presence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0252Unique No: 5763467Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 24 Apr 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02630335 (Generated: 04/24/2024 08:43:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Crane - Sue Hooton - VOLVO0252

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP448158 VCP429984 VCP332505 VCP053787Sample Date 18 Apr 2024 11 Oct 2023 08 Apr 2022 11 Jun 2021Machine Hours 13269 12519 10494 8744Oil Hours 1000 12519 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 137 120 56.4 140
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.446 NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 2 7 8 3Sodium ppm <1 2 1 <1Potassium ppm <1 0 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 47 158 297 21Copper ppm 2 8 12 1Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 2 5 3 <1Chromium ppm <1 2 3 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 0 <1 0Nickel ppm 0 <1 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Manganese ppm 1 2 3 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 24 32 21 28Magnesium ppm 4 7 4 1Zinc ppm 12 11 23 8Phosphorus ppm 1011 1166 2352 1003Barium ppm 0 <1 0 0Boron ppm 184 196 143 165

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02630335 (Generated: 04/24/2024 08:43:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Crane - Sue Hooton - VOLVO0252
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC380EL VCE380EJ00310375\Swing Drive [VCP448158] 18 Apr 2024 @ 13269.2 hrs

