
[[5480]] 352150 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP392999
Oil Type: VOLVO EXTRA AUTOMATIC FLUID
Job No: 5480

GREAT WEST EQUIPMENT1600 KOSMINA ROAD, 123 L&A CROSS RDVERNON, BCCA  V1T 8T2Contact: Sarah Lawrenceslawrence@gwequipment.comT: (866)627-2357F: (250)549-3397
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain thefluid from the component if this hasnot already been done. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Nickel ppmlevels are severe. Tin ppm levels areabnormal. Bearing wear is indicated.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. The fluid isno longer serviceable as a result ofthe abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: MARVERUnique No: 5763780Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 22 Apr 2024
Report Id: MARVER [WCAMIS] 02630648 (Generated: 04/22/2024 19:59:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Sarah Lawrence - MARVER

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP392999 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5936 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 25.7 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 8 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 83 --- --- ---Copper ppm 149 --- --- ---Lead ppm 3 --- --- ---Tin ppm 19 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 42 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 24 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 89 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 7 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 148 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 52 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: MARVER [WCAMIS] 02630648 (Generated: 04/22/2024 19:59:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Sarah Lawrence - MARVER
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 352150\Transmission (Auto) [VCP392999] 15 Apr 2024 @ 5936.0 hrs

