
[GFL [8-404316]] VOLVO A40G 353367 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP450488
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: 8-404316

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.1640 ENTERPRISE ROADMISSISSAUGA, ONCA  L4W 4L4Contact: Janice Crippsjcripps@strongco.comT: (905)565-3876F: (905)670-2338
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the airfilter, air induction system, and anyareas where dirt may enter thecomponent. We recommend that youdrain the oil from the component ifthis has not already been done. Oiland filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. The fluid wasnot specified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is SAE 30Diesel Engine Oil.  Please confirm theoil type and grade, and specify thebrand of the oil on your nextsample.Nickel ppm levels areabnormal. Exhaust valve wear isindicated. There is a moderateconcentration of dirt present in theoil. Tests indicate that there is no fuelpresent in the oil. High amount ofingressed dirt has caused abrasivewear to the component. Viscosity ofsample indicates oil is within SAE 30range, advise investigate. The oil isno longer serviceable as a result ofthe abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: SHEMISUnique No: 5785489Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 21 May 2024
Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02636327 (Generated: 05/21/2024 10:58:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP450488 --- --- ---Sample Date 14 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1178 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 10.9 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 65 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 88 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 67 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 0.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 26 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 22 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 28 --- --- ---Copper ppm 211 --- --- ---Lead ppm 6 --- --- ---Tin ppm 3 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 74 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 4 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1977 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 102 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 973 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 833 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 12 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02636327 (Generated: 05/21/2024 10:58:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 353367\Diesel Engine [VCP450488] 14 May 2024 @ 1178.0 hrs

