
[GFL [8-404316]] VOLVO A40G 353367 - UNKNOWN COMPONENT

Sample No: VCP392878
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: 8-404316

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.1640 ENTERPRISE ROADMISSISSAUGA, ONCA  L4W 4L4Contact: Janice Crippsjcripps@strongco.comT: (905)565-3876F: (905)670-2338
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere contaminants can enter thesystem. We recommend that youdrain the sample from thecomponent if this has not alreadybeen done. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor this condition.Please specify the brand, type, andviscosity of the oil on your nextsample.Aluminum and copper ppmlevels are marginal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.Excessive free water present. Thesample contained a visible layer offoreign fluid contaminant, the originand/or type of fluid is unknown. Thesample is no longer serviceable dueto the presence of contaminants.

Depot: SHEMISUnique No: 5785590Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 21 May 2024
Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02636428 (Generated: 05/21/2024 08:04:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP392878 --- --- ---Sample Date 14 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1178 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 1038 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 50 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1068 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 17 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 19 --- --- ---Copper ppm 96 --- --- ---Lead ppm 3 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 45 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 22 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 8 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 435 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 5 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 884 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 158 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 26 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02636428 (Generated: 05/21/2024 08:04:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 353367\Unknown Component [VCP392878] 14 May 2024 @ 1178.0 hrs

