
[EMPEREUR CONSTRUCTION [405111]] VOLVO L330F 62215 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP448105
Oil Type: IRVING TD-10
Job No: 405111

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT54 IBER ROADOTTAWA, ONCA  K2S 1E8Contact: Daniel Simarddsimard@strongco.comT: (613)836-6633F: (613)836-2614
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Test for glycol isnegative. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: SHESTIUnique No: 5788371Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 03 Jun 2024
Report Id: SHESTI [WCAMIS] 02639209 (Generated: 06/03/2024 18:05:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Daniel Simard - SHESTI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP448105 --- --- ---Sample Date 17 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1990 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 46.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 12 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 30 --- --- ---Copper ppm 247 --- --- ---Lead ppm 6 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2305 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 47 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 958 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 833 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 55 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHESTI [WCAMIS] 02639209 (Generated: 06/03/2024 18:05:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Daniel Simard - SHESTI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L330F 62215\Transmission [VCP448105] 17 May 2024 @ 1990.0 hrs

