
[TREEWORKS [8000409458]] VOLVO ECR145E 316021 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP450320
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 8000409458

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.55 ISNOR DRIVE, BURNSIDE INDUSTRIALPARKDARTMOUTH, NSCA  B3B 1N6Contact: Justin Hennigarjhennigar@strongco.comT: (902)468-5010F: (902)468-2468
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SHEDARUnique No: 5802674Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 03 Jul 2024
Report Id: SHEDAR [WCAMIS] 02645135 (Generated: 07/03/2024 13:55:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Justin Hennigar - SHEDAR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP450320 VCP392025 --- ---Sample Date 28 Jun 2024 01 Dec 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 1458 977 --- ---Oil Hours 500 500 --- ---Oil Changed N/A Changed --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.5 12.7 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 83 81 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Soot % % 0.2 0.2 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 63 66 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 62 61 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 1.7 --- ---Silicon ppm 5 8 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 3 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 23 41 --- ---Copper ppm 1 4 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 18 --- ---Chromium ppm 1 2 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 38 35 --- ---Nickel ppm 1 3 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1684 1699 --- ---Magnesium ppm 486 438 --- ---Zinc ppm 1005 1046 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 826 859 --- ---Barium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Boron ppm 36 34 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEDAR [WCAMIS] 02645135 (Generated: 07/03/2024 13:55:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Justin Hennigar - SHEDAR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR145E 316021\Diesel Engine [VCP450320] 28 Jun 2024 @ 1458.0 hrs

