
[RED PATH SUGAR [8-407619]] SENNEBOGEN 880 8807123 (S/N 880.7.123) - POWER TAKE OFF

Sample No: VCP450274
Oil Type: SHELL OMALA S4 GXV 220
Job No: 8-407619

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.1640 ENTERPRISE ROADMISSISSAUGA, ONCA  L4W 4L4Contact: Janice Crippsjcripps@strongco.comT: (905)565-3876F: (905)670-2338
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SHEMISUnique No: 5811901Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 09 Jul 2024
Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02646349 (Generated: 07/09/2024 08:27:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP450274 VCP380056 --- ---Sample Date 04 Jul 2024 10 Apr 2024 --- ---Machine Hours 17266 16975 --- ---Oil Hours 165 250 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 202 162 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 2 1 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 9 --- ---Copper ppm <1 <1 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 0 0 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 0 --- ---Zinc ppm 3 7 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 399 354 --- ---Barium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Boron ppm 25 21 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02646349 (Generated: 07/09/2024 08:27:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 880 8807123 (S/N 880.7.123)\Power Take Off [VCP450274] 04 Jul 2024 @ 17266.0 hrs

