
VOLVO L110 61153 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP099013
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No:

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - MANASSAS8450 QUARRY ROADMANASSAS, VAUS  20110Contact: MIKE MAYHUGHMMAYHUGH@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: (703)393-7344F: (703)393-7844
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor. Note that there appears tobe a discrepancy in the total time onthis component, when compared tothe historical data.All componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe component. The oil viscosity islower than normal.

Depot: VOLVO0002Unique No: 5836648Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 29 Feb 2012
Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 03024614 (Generated: 10/24/2023 08:44:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP099013 VCP095504 VCP113857 VCP113919Sample Date 23 Feb 2012 21 Feb 2012 29 Dec 2011 02 Jun 2011Machine Hours 20104 520 20248 19086Oil Hours 0 520 1425 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status MARGINAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.00 11.91 13.4 10.98Oxidation (PA) % 68 52 76 72
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 1 0.6 0.9 0.3Nitration (PA) % 67 58 92 75Sulfation (PA) % 69 53 72 69Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 0.0Silicon ppm 4 27 7 5Sodium ppm 7 5 7 8Potassium ppm 3 3 3 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 26 67 34 10Copper ppm 5 16 29 <1Lead ppm <1 4 7 <1Tin ppm <1 4 0 0Aluminum ppm 4 22 4 3Chromium ppm 1 5 2 <1Molybdenum ppm 153 50 148 133Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 1 0 0Manganese ppm <1 4 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4784 1239 4082 4139Magnesium ppm 40 842 404 11Zinc ppm 1446 1080 1560 1379Phosphorus ppm 1308 973 1285 1187Barium ppm <1 2 0 0Boron ppm 2 69 12 <1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 03024614 (Generated: 10/24/2023 08:44:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110 61153\Diesel Engine [VCP099013] 23 Feb 2012 @ 20104.0 hrs

