
VOLVO A25E 73007 - FRONT RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCE169981
Oil Type: SAE 85W140
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC (STE- FOY)175, rue de RotterdamSt-Augustin-de-Desmaures, QCCA  G3A 2K2Contact: Michel Lepagemlepage@strongco.comT: (418)870-1700F: (418)870-1701
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0228Unique No: 5946862Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 18 Jun 2012
Report Id: VOLVO0228 [WUSCAR] 03089727 (Generated: 09/28/2023 08:24:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Michel Lepage - VOLVO0228

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE169981 VCE110079 --- ---Sample Date 07 Jun 2012 25 Feb 2011 --- ---Machine Hours 4613 2191 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 320.3 89.27 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 39 6 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 3 --- ---Potassium ppm 3 3 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 312 692 --- ---Copper ppm 28 69 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 3 --- ---Aluminum ppm 7 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 6 12 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 4 10 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 6 16 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 58 22 --- ---Magnesium ppm 114 862 --- ---Zinc ppm 50 14 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 435 1560 --- ---Barium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Boron ppm 60 442 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0228 [WUSCAR] 03089727 (Generated: 09/28/2023 08:24:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Michel Lepage - VOLVO0228
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25E 73007\Front Right Final Drive [VCE169981] 07 Jun 2012 @ 4613.0 hrs

