
VOLVO A25E 73007 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCE169965
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT (GREEN)
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC (STE- FOY)175, rue de RotterdamSt-Augustin-de-Desmaures, QCCA  G3A 2K2Contact: Michel Lepagemlepage@strongco.comT: (418)870-1700F: (418)870-1701
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. There is no indication ofany contamination in the component.The nitrite level is low. The glycollevel is acceptable. The pH level ofthis fluid is within the acceptablelimits.

Depot: VOLVO0228Unique No: 5947001Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 22 Jun 2012
Report Id: VOLVO0228 [WUSCAR] 03089866 (Generated: 09/28/2023 08:23:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Michel Lepage - VOLVO0228

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE169965 VCE110415 --- ---Sample Date 07 Jun 2012 25 Feb 2011 --- ---Machine Hours 4613 2191 --- ---Sample Status MARGINAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.40 7.30 --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 720 560 --- ---Percentage Glycol % 46 45 --- ---Freezing Point °C -25 -22 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal normal --- ---Coolant Color Yllow Yllow --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0228 [WUSCAR] 03089866 (Generated: 09/28/2023 08:23:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Michel Lepage - VOLVO0228
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25E 73007\Coolant [VCE169965] 07 Jun 2012 @ 4613.0 hrs

