
VOLVO A40F 11213 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCE159409
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: PAUL ELZERMANpaul.elzerman@altaequipment.comT: (248)356-5200F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The amount and size ofparticulates present in the system isacceptable. There is no indication ofany contamination in the component.The condition of oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 5960270Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 03 Jul 2012
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 03098130 (Generated: 11/27/2023 15:15:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL ELZERMAN - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE159409 VCE114696 --- ---Sample Date 27 Jun 2012 09 May 2012 --- ---Machine Hours 1568 1047 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed N/A N/A --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.13 41.89 --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.438 0.630 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Particles >4µm 383 467 --- ---Particles >6µm 209 254 --- ---Particles >14µm 35 43 --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 16/15/12 16/15/13 --- ---Silicon ppm 13 9 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 10 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 2 --- ---Copper ppm 3 3 --- ---Lead ppm <1 5 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 0 0 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 46 52 --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 0 --- ---Zinc ppm 598 534 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 540 450 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 0 <1 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 03098130 (Generated: 11/27/2023 15:15:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL ELZERMAN - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40F 11213\Hydraulic System [VCE159409] 27 Jun 2012 @ 1568.0 hrs

